
Miscellaneous Costs from Qualified Vendors under the Septic Improvement Program REVISED 03-13-24

Item Description

A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit

 A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit

 Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit

 Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit Pricing 

CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit

 CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit

 Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit Pricing 

Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit

 Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit 

Pricing 

John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit

 John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Ken Rousell, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Ken 
Rousell, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 

Unit

 M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 
Unit Pricing 

Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit

 Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit

 Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit 

Pricing 

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 

Unit

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 
Unit Pricing

Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit

 Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit 
Pricing 

Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit

 Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit 

Pricing 

South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit

 South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit 

Pricing 

TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit

 TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit 

Pricing 

Mobilization and 
Access

1
Private Utility 
Markouts EACH $800 EACH $1,500 Per Utility $250 Per Hour $350 LS $600 Per Markout $750-$950 LS $300 Hourly $300 each $350 1

$475/$800 - 
TBD based 

on site
Per Man 

Hour $225 1 $3,000 LS $315 Ea $750 $300 $400 1 $500.00 ea. Each $500 Each $880 Ea. $695 Per Hour $300 each $800 1 $1,600 per markout $250 

2

Narrow roadway 
access limited 
machine access 
Demurrage CREW HOUR $368 PER HOUR $350 Crew Hour $400 LS $800 Crew Hour $285 Crew Hour $300 Hourly $320 crew hour $350 2 man crew

$275 per 
hour Per Man Hour $225 1 $4,000 Crew Hour $315 Crew Hour $550 $1,000 Full Day $2,000 

2 man crew 
150/hr

$1,200.00/da
y 1/2 day $2,000 crew hour $517 per hour $450 Per Hour $375 crew hour $375 1 $3,000 

3

Vegetation / Brush 
Removal / Tree 
Pruning to allow 
access for system 
installation MAN HOUR $110 PER HOUR $350 5' or more $60 Man Hour $150 Man Hour $125 Man Hour $95 Man Hour $100 Hourly $125 man hour $125 $150 Per Man Hour $225 1 $5,000 Man Hour $100 CY $72 $25 Full Day $4,000 

2 man crew 
150/hr 

$1,200.00/da
y Per Yard $200 man hour $165 CY $75 Per Hour $150 man hour $150 1 $3,000 

4

Excavate, remove 
and dispose of 
stumps EACH $250 PER STUMP $1,000 12"+ $100-450 CY $200 CY $40 Flat Fee Range $250-$850 Per Stump $500 per structure $300 CY $70 $200 Per Man Hour $500 1 $5,000 Per Stump $525 CY $72 CY $75 $2,000 1 $450.00 ea. Per Yard $200 CY $132 CY $75 Per Stump $250 flat fee  $275-$600 1 $400 CY $50 

5
Fence removal and 
re-set 

LF (Removal 
ONLY) $15 LF TBD Per 12' $250 By Owner Man Hour $125 Flat Fee Range $250-$850 LS TBD per section $250 by owner by owner $25 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $5,000 LS TBD - - CY $300 PER HOUR $300 8' section $175.00 ea. per 8' section $110 TBD  TBD By Owner tbd 1 $1,500 per hour $150 

6

Relocate and reset 
sheds or other small 
structures LS $4,000 TBD Per Structure $250 By Owner N/A

Priced case by 
case ** LS TBD

per 
structure $1,500 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $3,000 LS TBD - - $600 Full Day $2,000 1 $700.00 ea. each $2,750 By Owner By Owner tbd 1 $3,500 

7

Soft ground / 
Access protection 
matting SY $95 TBD N/A $450 SY $100 LS $2,500 

Priced case by 
case ** SY TBD per piece $80 SY $100 sy $110 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $4,000 SY TBD Sq. Ft. $10 Ln Ft $20 $1,000 30' $2,200 Sy $104.50 Ea. $100 SY $100 sy $100 1 $12,500 SY $50 

8

Added Surface 
improvements RCA 
base CY $45 CY $45 CY $15 CY CY $50 CY $35 CY TBD CY $60 CY $65 CY $55 CY $500 50 $50 CY TBD CY $78 CY $40 CY $200 CY $30 CY CY $55 CY $60 CY installed $60 CY CY $65 CY $35 

9

Use Dunnage to 
protect existing 
conditions SY $95 TBD N/A N/A LS $300 LS $750 Flat Fee $500 LS TBD per piece $80 LS $500 tbd  tbd Per LF $1,000 1 $2,000 LS TBD Sq. Ft. $10 N/A Full Day $2,000 per unit $750 SY $88 sy $100 flat fee $500 1 $3,600 

10

Additional 
equipment required 
for access per day $1,500 per day $2,500 per day $700 per day per day $2,500 per day $1,800 per day TBD per day $2,000 per day $1,900 per day $1,500 per day $2,000 per day TBD per day $2,500 per day $1,400 PER DAY $2,000 per day $1,600 per day per day $3,000 per day $2,500 per day $1,500 per day $6,500 per day $1,700 

11

Crane, Excavator or 
other equip > 25 
ton mobilization per day $2,500 per day $2,500 per day $800-1,500 per day $3,500 per day $5,000 per day $4,500 per day TBD per day $8,500 per day $3,000 per day $3,000 per day $7,500 per day $6,000 per day TBD per day $4,000 per day $2,000 PER DAY $4,000 per day $3,500 per day per day $3,000 per day $4,500 per day $3,500 per day $1,800 per day $4,500 per day

12
Crane for deep 
excavations per day $6,500 per day $3,500 per day $3,000 EA $10,000 per day $6,000 

Priced case by 
case ** per day TBD per day $8,500 per day $4,500 per day $3,000 per day $10,000 per day $6,000 per day TBD per day $4,000 per day $2,400 PER DAY $4,000 per day $4,500 per day $4,500 per day $11,000 per day $4,500 per day $3,500 each $9,500 per day $5,500 per day

13

Crane Lifting for 
long-reach or heavy 
load applications per day $6,500 per day $3,500 per day $2,500 EA $10,000 per day $6,000 per day $6,750 per day TBD per day $8,500 per day $4,500 per day $2,500 per day $7,500 per day per day TBD per day $4,000 per day $1,800 PER DAY $4,000 per day $4,500 per day per day $8,250 per day $4,500 per day $3,500 per day $9,500 per day $4,500 per day



Miscellaneous Costs from Qualified Vendors under the Septic Improvement Program REVISED 03-13-24

Item Description

A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit

 A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit

 Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit

 Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit Pricing 

CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit

 CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit

 Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit Pricing 

Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit

 Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit 

Pricing 

John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit

 John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Ken Rousell, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Ken 
Rousell, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 

Unit

 M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 
Unit Pricing 

Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit

 Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit

 Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit 

Pricing 

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 

Unit

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 
Unit Pricing

Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit

 Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit 
Pricing 

Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit

 Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit 

Pricing 

South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit

 South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit 

Pricing 

TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit

 TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit 

Pricing 

Installation 
Conflicts Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price 

14
Remove existing 
house trap LS $400 PER $1,000 

Visible-Under 
Slab $750-$1250 LS $900 per trap $1,500-$1,800 LS TBD EA $400 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $1,000 LS TBD - - $200 $1,000 1 $500 EACH $275 Ea. $500 per trap tbd 1 $5,500 per $375 

15
Re-route interior 
plumbing LS

$2,000-
$10,000 TBD N/A $1,000-$7,000 LF $150 Man Hour $150 Flat Fee Range $1,950-$7,500 LF TBD LF $200 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $325 1 $10,000 LF TBD - - N/A TBD 20' max $1,850 per hour $500 LF $198 Ea.

$1,000-
$10,000 By Owner  tbd 1 $10,500 

16

Install Exterior 
Pump chamber to 
lift effluent to new 
system LS $15,000 TBD N/A $3,000-$7,000 EA $20,000 N/A Flat Fee Range $2,000-$4,500 EA TBD LS $10,500 TBD TBD ea $4,000 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $10,000 EA TBD - - N/A TBD 1 $5,250 LS $17,600 Ea. $22,000 

TBD- based 
on design  tbd 1 $30,000 

17

Install pump pit to 
route interior 
plumbing LS $8,500 TBD N/A $2,500-4,000 EA $6,000 N/A Flat Fee Range $2,000-$4,500 LS TBD LS $5,000 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $10,000 LS TBD - - N/A TBD 1 $2,450 LS $5,500 Ea.

$1,000-
$10,000

TBD- based 
on design  tbd 1 $15,000 

18

Reinforce or install 
H-20 Loading 
Improvements - top 
bearing slab $6,000 

PER 8' 
STRUCTURE $1,000 N/A N/A EA $2,500 Each $200 Flat Fee Range $3,500-$8,500 SF TBD EA $1,000 each $800 8' dia $1,500 

Per Man 
Hour $325 1 $5,000 SF TBD Ea $550 Per Structure $150 TBD 8' diameter $900.00 ea. EACH $1,650 Ea. $7,500 6000 each $3,000 1 $7,800 

19
H-20 Loading HD 
Casting EACH $500 PER STRUCTURE $800 N/A N/A EA $1,000 Each $300 Per Casting $475 EA $600 EA $1,000 each $575 ea $550 

Per Man 
Hour $325 1 $1,000 EA $650 Ea $550 Per Casting $425 TBD 1 $550 EACH $825 Ea. $595 1000 each $800 1 $800 

20

Dewater < 45 GPM 
No permit (with 
digging box) LS $7,000 P/D $7,000 Per Day $6,000 LS $3,500 LS $4,000 Per Day $4,500 LS $3,500 LS $5,000 LS $5,000 day $3,500 

Per Man 
Hour $275 1 $10,000 LS $3,575 Ea $16,200 N/A TBD per day $3,200 $4,000 LS $7,150 Per Day $18,000 NA per day $4,500 1 $6,500 

21
Concrete Anti 
Floatation Systems LS $1,400 PER $2,500 Deadmen $750 EA $2,000 LS $1,800 Per Tank $1,400 EA $1,000 EA $1,600 each $1,750 ea $3,000 

Per Purchase 
Price $1,500 1 $6,000 EA $1,050 Ea $1,700 Per Tank $2,100 TBD 1 $2,500 

$1,900 - 
$2,500 LS $3,300 Ea. $1,800 EA $1,800 tbd Per unit $10,500 $1,500 

22

Installation of (2) 
Helical Piles for anti 
buoyancy EACH $1,000 TBD $1,600 EA $2,000 LS $4,000 

Priced case by 
case ** EA TBD LS $3,200 each $2,400 ea $2,500 

Per Helical 
Pile $475 1 $6,000 EA TBD - - $2,800 TBD  TBD LS $2,750 Ea. $3,500 EA $2,000 per 2 $1,200 1 $8,500 



Miscellaneous Costs from Qualified Vendors under the Septic Improvement Program REVISED 03-13-24

Item Description

A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit

 A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit

 Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit

 Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit Pricing 

CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit

 CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit

 Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit Pricing 

Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit

 Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit 

Pricing 

John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit

 John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Ken Rousell, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Ken 
Rousell, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 

Unit

 M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 
Unit Pricing 

Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit

 Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit

 Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit 

Pricing 

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 

Unit

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 
Unit Pricing

Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit

 Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit 
Pricing 

Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit

 Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit 

Pricing 

South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit

 South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit 

Pricing 

TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit

 TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit 

Pricing 

Installation Extras Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price 

23 Hourly Labor Rate Hourly $185 Hourly $200 Hourly N/A Hourly Hourly $125 Hourly $625 Hourly $100 Hourly $350 Hourly $125 
 hourly- per 

person $56.25 Hourly Hourly $500 Hourly $100 Hourly $100 Hourly $125 Hourly Hourly $75 Hourly $500 Hourly $150 Hourly $275 Hourly $150 Hourly Hourly $250 per hour $85 

24

If excavation 
inspection is 
required (poor soils, 
PSD, etc.) LS $3,500 $2,000 Per Inspection $800 EA $3,500 LS $1,500 

(1) Additional 
Day $5,000 LS $3,000 EA $1,500 LS $1,800 $500 

Per Man 
Hour $225 $3,000 LS $3,150 Per day $2,500 $300 $200 1 $1,500 $2,000 LS $2,200 Ea. $1,800 EA $2,500 each $3,500 Per unit $2,200 per hour $255 

25

Install new cast iron 
plumbing through 
foundation LS $800 $2,000 5' w/ hub $1,200 LS $500 

Per 5' length of 
4" $550 LS TBD 2' piece $729 TBD TBD tbd Per Item $500 $1,000 LS TBD - - $500 $1,000 1 $650 LS $2,000 Ea. $2,500 per 5' $675 Per unit $2,400 $475 

26

Supply water to fill 
tank if not available 
on site LS $600 TBD Per gal .50-$1.50 N/A Ls $800 Per 200gals $500 LS TBD GAL $4 TBD TBD $1,300 

Per Man 
Hour $1,500 $2,000 LS TBD Ea $2,000 $900 $500 1,000 gal. $1,600 GALLON $2 1,000 gal $1,800 EA $750 

per 
200gallons $500 Per unit $2,200 

27
Import Sand 
(bankrun) CY $50 CY $50 CY $50 CY $50 CY $35 CY $30-$75 CY $45 CY $50 CY $50 CY $65 CY $225 CY $50 CY $50 CY $42 CY $35 $50 CY $75 CY $40 CY $44 CY $50 CY $50 CY $45 CY $60 CY $30 

28

Import Sand (C33 
for shallow drain 
fields) CY $70 CY $50 CY $50 CY CY $40 CY $45-$95 CY $45 CY $50 CY $55 CY $65 CY $750 CY $50 CY $50 CY $48 CY $40 $50 CY $75 CY $60 CY $44 CY $50 CY CY $100 CY $75 CY $50 

29
Import Fill / 
Grading Material CY $65 CY $45 CY $30 CY $60 CY $24 CY $30-$65 CY $25 CY $50 CY $38 CY $45 CY $750 CY $50 CY $30 CY $38 CY $20 $50 CY $35 CY $20 CY $50 CY $40 CY $45 CY $35 CY $35 CY $18 

30
Export and Dispose 
of Clean Fill CY $65 CY $35 CY $45 CY $30 CY $25 CY $30-$65 CY $19 CY $50 CY $36 CY $65 CY $500 CY $50 CY $20 CY $38 CY $10 $70 CY $35 CY $40 CY $44 CY $40 CY $30 CY $30 CY $65 CY $15 

31

Export and Dispose 
of Unsuitable Fill 
Removals (Clay, 
Bog, etc.) CY $85 CY $80 CY $70 CY CY $40 CY $45-$75 CY $25 CY $50 CY $36 CY $70 CY $1,000 CY $50 CY $30 CY $38 CY $30 $100 CY $40 CY CY $50 CY $60 CY CY $45 CY $70 CY $55 

32 Export Concrete CY $50 CY $60 CY $65 CY CY $40 CY $45-$75 CY $42.50 CY $75 CY $55 CY $60 CY $500 CY $50 CY $45 CY $42 CY $50 $100 CY $30 CY $55 CY $85 CY $60 CY $40 CY $50 CY $65 CY $40 
33 Export Asphalt CY $80 CY $60 CY $50 CY CY $50 CY $45-$75 CY $42.50 CY $75 CY $55 CY $70 CY $750 CY $50 CY $45 CY $50 CY $60 $100 CY $40 CY $55 CY $85 CY $80 CY $45 CY $75 CY $80 CY $50 

34

Pumping, 
Decommissioning, 
and Abandonment 
of Existing OWTS 
(assuming two 
existing structures) $2,500 $2,500 $2,000 LS $2,400 $750 LS $1,500 LS $978 LS $2,800 

2 structures 
only $1,750 Per Structure $5,000 $6,000 LS $1,575 Ea $2,450 $2,200 

$3,000 – 
$4,000 2 structures $2,800 $2,800 EACH $5,730 Ea. $1,800 $2,200 $3,500 1 $6,500 $3,500 

35

Abandon additional 
existing structures / 
pools per structure $750 per structure $1,000 per structure $800 per structure per structure $750 per structure $350 per structure TBD

per 
structure $450 per structure $1,000 per structure $1,000 Per Structure $5,000 per structure $2,000 per structure TBD per structure $1,000 per structure $250 $2,000 

per 
structure $1,800 per structure per structure $3,850 per structure $1,800 per structure per structure $1,500 per structure $1,200 

per 
structure $1,800 

36

Additional pump 
out per 1,000 
gallons 1,000 Gallons $525 1,000 Gallons $500 1,000 Gallons $450 1,000 Gallons 1,000 Gallons $850 1,000 Gallons $185-$200 1,000 Gallons $400 

1,000 
Gallons $350 

1,000 
Gallons $700 

1,000 
Gallons $650 

1,000 
Gallons $1,400 

1,000 
Gallons $2,000 

1,000 
Gallons $450 

1,000 
Gallons $875 

1,000 
Gallons $800 GALLONS $2,000 

1,000 
Gallons $400 1,000 Gallons $500 1,000 Gallons $675 1,000 Gallons $495 1,000 Gallons 1,000 Gallons $1,200 1,000 Gallons $475 

1,000 
Gallons

37

Removal and 
disposal of existing 
cesspools/septic 
tanks per structure $700 per structure $1,500 per structure $800 per structure $3,500 per structure $600 per structure $1,550 per structure TBD

per 
structure $1,750 per structure $1,100 per structure $1,750 Per Structure $8,500 per structure $2,000 per structure TBD per structure $1,050 per structure $750 

$3,000 – 
$4,000

per 
structure $1,000 per structure $750 per structure $3,850 per structure $1,200 per structure per structure $3,500 per structure $1,800 

per 
structure $1,800 

38

Field Area 
protection Fence – 
Split Rail

DEPENDS ON 
SITE $800-$3,000 N/A Per site $300 N/A N/A Per foot $20 

Priced case by 
case ** LF TBD LF $75 TBD TBD tbd  tbd Per Unit $1,500 $3,000 LF TBD - - N/A TBD Lf $30 LF $100 TBD NA tbd LF $300 

39

Low-line out 
Shoring System 
installation face of 
shoring (Includes 
OSHA Trench and 
Shore Certified 
Supervisor) LS $2,500 TBD N/A N/A EA $12,000 LS $4,000 

Priced case by 
case ** SF TBD SF $125 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $400 $15,000 SF TBD - - N/A TBD ea. $1,500 LS $7,150  TBD  tbd NO BID

40

Low-line Additional 
excavation depth > 
7 Ft (combined with 
shoring above) LS $4,000 TBD $1,000 $1,000 EA $17,000 LS $3,500 

Priced case by 
case ** CY TBD CY $250 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $650 $15,000 CY TBD - - N/A TBD ea. $1,500 CY $55  TBD tbd NO BID

41
Retaining walls 
(concrete) CY $500 CY TBD CY N/A CY CY $750 

Priced case by 
case ** CY TBD

priced 
according to 

plan CY TBD CY $550 CY $2,800 CY $500 CY TBD CY - CY N/A TBD CY TBD CY CY N/A CY  TBD 
TBD- based 
on design CY $700 CY NO BID CY

42
Retaining walls 
(wood) CF  N/A CF  TBD CF N/A CF CF N/A

Priced case by 
case ** CF TBD

priced 
according to 

plan CF TBD CF CF $400 CF $500 CF  TBD CF - CF N/A TBD CF TBD CF CF N/A CF  TBD 
TBD- based 
on design CF $45 CF  NO BID CF

43
Site Controls - Hay 
Bale EACH $19 PER $25 N/A LF $25 LF $10 

Priced case by 
case ** EA TBD EA $25 per $28 fsf tbd

Per Man 
Hour $325 10LF $10 EA TBD Ea $28 Per Ln Ft $6 TBD 1 $15 LF $33 Ea. $30 NA ft $15 

Per linear 
foot $20 

44
Site Controls - Silt 
Fence LF $8.50 PER LF $10 Per site $300 LF $25 LF $10 

Priced case by 
case ** LF TBD LF $13 LF $18 lf $15.06 LF $750 10LF $10 LF TBD LF $18 Per Ln, Ft $12 TBD 100 ft. $250 LF $33 LF $20 LF $10 $5 

Per linear 
foot $40 

49

Electrical per FT 
price over 50' for 
control panel LF $30 TBD Material N/A LF $7 per foot $9 LF TBD LF $35 LF $30 lf $50 

Per Man 
Hour $350 100LF $100 LF TBD LF $50 N/A TBD ft. $30 Per foot $20 LF $33 LF $50 LF $30  tbd Per foot $20 per foot $4.75 

45

Conduit runs > 40 
feet (Remote 
Panels) LF $30 TBD Material N/A LF $5 per foot $45 LF TBD LF $35 LF $32 lf $40 LF $75 $4,000 LF TBD LF $33 N/A TBD LF $30 LF $50 ft $15 NO BID

46

Generator Transfer 
Switch – System 
only LS $650 TBD N/A N/A By Owner N/A

Varies w/ 
manufacturer $650-$950 LS TBD LS $195 each TBD ea $1,200 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $5,000 LS TBD - - N/A TBD 1 $2,500 LS $3,850  TBD By Owner  tbd NO BID

47
Communications 
Panel upgrade

DEPENDS ON 
SYSTEM  $650-$2,500  TBD N/A N/A EA $750 N/A

Priced case by 
case ** LS TBD EA $350 each TBD ea $1,000 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $5,000 LS  TBD Ea $2,500 N/A TBD TBD LS $6,600 Ea. $3,500  tbd NO BID

48 WIFI Messenger EACH $450 TBD N/A N/A N/A
Priced case by 

case ** LS TBD

Priced 
through 
provider each TBD tbd tbd

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $5,000 LS TBD Ea $2,500 N/A TBD TBD LS $2,500  TBD  tbd NO BID

49

Install tandem 
breaker in existing 
panel EACH $45 TBD N/A N/A EA $800 N/A Per Breaker $450 LS TBD EA $165 lump sum TBD ea $150 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $5,000 LS TBD - - N/A TBD $300 LS $2,200 Ea. $1,200  tbd 1 $350 

50

Install new 
electrical sub-panel 
if needed to meet 
code. LS $2,500 TBD N/A N/A EA $3,000 N/A Price Range $850-$3,500 LS TBD

Priced 
through 

electrician each TBD tbd  tbd 
Per Man 

Hour $225 1 $10,000 LS TBD - - N/A TBD $2,500 LS $2,750 Ea. $4,500 
Per 

Electrician  tbd $3,000 

51 Price per clean out EACH $65 $500 Per CO $200 EA $150 Each $300 Per Cleanout $275 EA TBD EA $250 each $250 ea $250 
Per Man 

Hour $275 1 $2,000 EA TBD Ea $250 
Per Clean 

Out $100 TBD 1 $500 each $250 EACH $935 Ea. $250 EA $150 each $150 1 $125 $105 

52
Additional riser cost 
over 6" (poly)

DEPENDS ON 
MANUFACTURE

R $35-$85 $150 6" $85 LF $170 Each $150 Per Riser $200 VF TBD EA $125 each $125 ea $150 
Per Man 

Hour $25 1 $1,000 VF TBD Ea $75 Per Foot $300 $200 1 $75 EACH $110 Ea. $80 $170 each $200 $1 $165 $65 

53
Additional riser cost 
over 6" (concrete) EACH 6" $45 - 1' $60 $150 Per Foot $100 Per Riser $200 VF TBD EA $125 each $125 ea $125 

Per Man 
Hour $325 1 $1,000 VF TBD Ea $75 Per Foot $550 $200 $65 EACH $150 Ea. $75 each $200 1 $150 $75 

54
Poly distribution 
box EACH $425 $800 Installed $500 EA $450 Each $500 Per Box $350 EA $350 EA $325 each $400 ea $500 Per Box $475 1 $1,000 EA $375 Ea $650 $350 $500 1 $450 $500 EACH $330 Ea. $350 EA $300 each $400 Per unit $585 $450 

55

Concrete 
Distribution 
Manhole EACH $1,700 $2,000 Installed $800 EA $2,000 Each $800 Price Range $1,500-$3,500 EA TBD EA $3,000 each $1,900 tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $225 1 $1,000 EA TBD Ea $1,800 $950 TBD 1 $1,500 EACH $2,035 Ea $1,900 EA $2,200 each $1,800 $1,300 $1,500 

56
Change-direction 
Manhole EACH $2,000 $1,500 N/A N/A EA $2,500 Each $1,200 Price Range $1,500-$3,500 LS TBD EA $3,000 each $1,900 tbd  tbd 

Per Man 
Hour $750 1 $1,000 LS TBD Ea $1,800 $1,250 TBD 1 $800 EACH $2,000 Ea $1,900 EA $2,200 each $2,500 $1,300 $1,500 

57 Poly pump tank EACH $1,000 TBD N/A N/A EA $3,500 Each inc. Pump $6,000 Price Range $2,250-$4,250 EA TBD EA $2,500 TBD TBD ea $2,500 Per Unit $1,850 1 $5,000 EA TBD Ea $3,450 N/A TBD 1 $800 EACH $2,000 Ea $3,500 each $2,000 1 $3,000 

58
4' diameter precast 
pump station EACH $1,800 TBD NA NA Each inc. Pump $7,500 4x4 $3,500 VF TBD EA $3,750 TBD TBD tbd  tbd 

Per Pump 
Station $1,500 1 $5,000 VF TBD Ea $5,250 N/A TBD 1 $2,800 LS $5,940 Ea $3,500 each $3,500 1 $1,600 

59

8' diameter 
leaching pool 
precast (in addition 
to first precast pool) VF $93 VF TBD VF $3,000 VF $175 VF $200 VF $85 VF TBD VF $125 VF $350 4 VF $1,000 VF $750 500VF $500 VF TBD VF $715 VF $80 $700 8' X 6' $1,850 VF $1,000 VF $787 VF $150 

TBD- based 
on design VF $200 VF $2,600 VF 4' $2,500 

60

10' diameter 
leaching pool 
precast (in addition 
to first precast pool) VF $125 VF TBD VF $4,500 2 Foot ED Each $750 VF $250 VF $130 VF TBD VF $250 VF $425 4 VF $1,500 VF $1,000 600VF $600 VF TBD VF $850 VF $120 $800 10' X 6' $2,450 VF VF $935 VF $4,250 

TBD- based 
on design VF $250 VF $4,100 VF 4' $3,500 

61 Additional 8' Slab EACH $550 $500 6"-8" $700-$1000 EA $350 Each $500 Per Slab $385 EA $410 EA $550 each $450 ea $925 Per Unit $2,500 1 $1,000 EA $430 Ea $400 $375 $700 1 $1,000 EACH $715 Ea $380 
TBD- based 
on design $900 Per unit $1,200 $750 

62 Additional 10' Slab EACH $800 $650 8" $1,250 EA $600 Each $1,000 Per Slab $650 EA $650 EA $650 each $750 ea $1,550 Per Unit $3,000 1 $2,000 EA $700 Ea $675 $625 $900 1 $1,200 EACH $800 Ea $750 
TBD- based 
on design $1,500 Per unit $2,200 $950 

63 Cement Cover EACH $65 $300 36" $250 Each $100 Per Cover $65 EA $60 EA $65 each $75 ea $65 Per Unit $4,000 1 $500 EA $65 Ea $75 $60 $200 1 $75 EACH $90 Ea $100 
TBD- based 
on design $95 Per unit $250 (1) 30" $75 

64

Leaching galley 
upcharge (instead 
of first precast pool)

LS (DEPENDS 
ON DESIGN) $500-$3,000 TBD Per Galley $850 EA $600 Each $500 

Priced case by 
case ** VF TBD EA $750 VF $175 2' ea $1,350 LF $500 1 $2,000 VF TBD VF $800 Per Galley $300 

$3,000 - 
$3,500 1 $3,800 VF $182 

Depends on 
Design  TBD 

TBD- based 
on design $2,000 Per unit $1,500 

65

Gravity trench 
system upcharge 
(instead of first 
precast pool)

DEPENDS ON 
MANUFACTURE

R  $1000-$4,000  TBD 4-8 Bedroom $5,000-12,000 LF $50 Per Foot $40 
Priced case by 

case ** VF TBD TBD TBD per design  tbd Per Unit $2,000 1 $5,000 VF  TBD Lf $380 N/A TBD 4 bedroom $10,200 LF $35 
Depends on 

Design  TBD 
TBD- based 
on design $2,500 



Miscellaneous Costs from Qualified Vendors under the Septic Improvement Program REVISED 03-13-24

Item Description

A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit

 A&A Sewer 
and Drain 

Maintenance, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 All Island 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Beltran 
Cesspools, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit

 Bridgewater 
Environmental 
Services, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Cardo Site 
Development, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit

 Clear River 
Environmental 
Service Corp.'s 

Unit Pricing 

CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit

 CMM 
Sitework, Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Direct 
Drainage, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit

 East End 
Excavating 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit

 Eastern Site 
Developme

nt, Inc.'s 
Unit Pricing 

Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Fire Island 
Plumbing 
Company, 
Inc.'s Unit 

Pricing 

Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit

 Guillo 
Contracting 
Corp.'s Unit 

Pricing 

John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit

 John Willis 
Co., Inc.'s 

Unit Pricing 

Ken Rousell, 
Inc.'s Unit

 Ken 
Rousell, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Latham 
Sand & 
Gravel, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 

Unit

 M & V 
Home Corp. 

DBA 
Brothers 

Three 
Cesspool's 
Unit Pricing 

Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit

 Manorville 
Precast 

Corp.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit

 Micro Earth 
Moving, 

Inc.'s Unit 
Pricing 

Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit

 Noyack 
Trucking & 
Excavation 
LLC’s Unit 

Pricing 

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 

Unit

Quackenbus
h Cesspools 
Unit Pricing

Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit

 Shelter 
Island Sand, 

Gravel, & 
Contracting, 

Inc.’s Unit 
Pricing 

Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit

 Siteworx NY 
Corp.’s Unit 

Pricing 

South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit

 South Fork 
Septic 

Services. 
Inc.’s Unit 

Pricing 

TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit

 TKF 
Excavation 

& 
Demolition, 
Ltd.’s Unit 

Pricing 

Operation & 
Maintenance 

(O&M) 
(if applicable) Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price Unit  Unit Price 

66 Pump Station O&M
INCLUDED IN 
PSD SYSTEM N/A N/A Per Station (py) $450 N/A N/A

Priced case by 
case ** Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $978 3-Year $550 3 year $1,775 

Per 
Mainenance 

Charge $250 LS TBD 3 year $800 N/A N/A
Included in 

PSD N/A 3 Year $1,200 

67

Geomat PSD O&M 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $450 N/A

4-8 Bedroom 
(py) $350-$700 N/A N/A

Priced case by 
case ** Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $977.63 3-Year $550 3 year $700 Per Contract $1,200 LS TBD 3 year $800 N/A N/A

3 Year 
Contract $450 $800 $450 3 Year $1,200 

68

Infiltrator PSD O&M 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $450 N/A

4-8 Bedroom 
(py) $350-$700 N/A N/A

Priced case by 
case ** Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $977.63 3-Year $550 3 year  tbd Per Contract $1,200 LS TBD 3 year $800 N/A N/A

3 Year 
Contract $450 $800 $450 N/A 3 Year $1,200 

69
Lined NRB Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A

Priced case by 
case ** Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract TBD TBD 3 year  tbd LS TBD 3 year $1,600 N/A N/A $1,500 NA N/A NO BID

70

Hydro-Action 
AN400 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $1,305 N/A Per Year $445 N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,335 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 3-Year $1,550 3 year $1,500 $6,000 LS $1,675 3 year $1,500 $1,335 3-Year $1,800 1 $1,775 

3 Year 
Contract $1,025 

Three-year 
Contract $1,335 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,335 3 Year $1,750 3 year $1,360 

71

Hydro-Action 
AN500 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $1,305 N/A Per Year $445 N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,335 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 3-Year $1,550 3 year $1,500 $6,000 LS $1,675 3 year $1,500 $1,335 3-Year $1,800 1 $1,775 

3 Year 
Contract $1,025 

Three-year 
Contract $1,335 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,335 3 Year $1,900 3 year $1,360 

72

Hydro-Action 
AN600 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $1,305 N/A Per Year $445 N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,335 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 3-Year $1,550 3 year $1,500 $8,000 LS $1,675 3 year $1,500 $1,335 3-Year $1,800 1 $1,775 

3 Year 
Contract $1,200 

Three-year 
Contract $1,335 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,335 3 Year $2,300 3 year $1,360 

73

Hydro-Action 
AN800 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $1,725 N/A Per Year $575 N/A 3 year $1,600 Per Unit $1,725 Three-year $1,850 

Three-year 
Contract $1,928.09 3-Year $1,925 3 year $1,850 $8,000 LS $1,875 3 year $1,800 $1,725 3-Year $2,100 1 $2,275 

3 Year 
Contract $1,950 

Three-year 
Contract $1,725 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,725 3 Year $2,500 

74

Hydro-Action 
AN1100 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $1,725 N/A Per Year $575 N/A 3 year $1,600 Per Unit $1,725 Three-year $1,850 

Three-year 
Contract $1,928.09 3-Year $1,925 3 year $1,850 $10,000 LS $1,875 3 year $1,800 $1,725 3-Year $2,100 1 $2,275 

3 Year 
Contract $1,950 

Three-year 
Contract $1,725 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,725 3 Year $3,100 

75

FujiClean CEN5 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,175 3 year $1,275 Per Unit $1,100 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 3-Year $1,400 3 year $1,850 Per Contract $1,500 $6,000 LS $1,675 3 year $1,500 $1,175 3-Year $1,800 1 $1,550 

3 Year 
Contract $1,300 

Three-year 
Contract $1,175.01 3 Yr $1,500 3 year $1,175 3 year $1,175 3 Year $1,750 3 year $1,225 

76

FujiClean CEN7 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,325 3 year $1,425 Per Unit $1,250 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 3-Year $1,500 3 year $1,300 Per Contract $1,650 $8,000 LS $1,675 3 year $1,500 $1,325 3-Year $1,800 1 $1,775 

3 Year 
Contract $1,500 

Three-year 
Contract $1,325.01 3 Yr $1,500 3 year $1,175 3 year $1,325 3 Year $1,900 3 year $1,350 

77

FujiClean CEN10 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,350 N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,475 3 year $1,575 Per Unit $1,400 Three-year $1,850 

Three-year 
Contract $1,656.53 3-Year $1,800 3 year $1,500 $8,000 LS $1,875 3 year $1,800 $1,475 3-Year $2,100 1 $1,950 

3 Year 
Contract $1,500 

Three-year 
Contract $1,475.01 3 Yr $1,800 3 year $1,450 3 year $1,475 3 Year $2,300 

78

FujiClean CEN14 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,500 N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,625 3 year $1,725 Per Unit $1,550 Three-year $1,850 

Three-year 
Contract $1,819.47 3-Year $1,900 3 year $1,335 $10,000 LS $1,875 3 year $1,800 $1,625 N/A 1 $2,150 

3 Year 
Contract $1,950 

Three-year 
Contract $1,625.01 3 Yr $1,800 3 year $1,600 3 year $1,625 3 Year $2,600 

79

FujiClean CEN21 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,650 N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,925 3 year $2,025 Per Unit $1,700 Three-year $1,850 

Three-year 
Contract $2,145.34 3-Year $2,200 3 year $2,100 $10,000 LS $1,875 3 year $2,100 $1,925 N/A 1 $2,500 

3 Year 
Contract $1,950 

Three-year 
Contract $1,925.01 3 Yr $1,800 3 year $1,900 3 year $1,925 3 Year $2,900 

79
Orenco AX20 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Per Unit N/A Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract N/A N/A n/a n/a LS TBD 3 year $2,300 N/A 3 Yr $1,500 NA NO BID

80

Norweco Singulair 
TNT 500/600 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,150 Per Unit $1,050 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a n/a Per Contract $1,250 LS TBD - - N/A 1 $1,400 

3 Year 
Contract $1,500 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,050 NO BID 3 year $1,075 

81

Norweco Singulair 
TNT 700/800 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,200 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a n/a Per Contract $1,400 LS  TBD - - N/A 1 $1,600 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,200 NO BID 3 year $1,225 

82

Norweco Singulair 
TNT 1000 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,450 Per Unit $1,350 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,575.06 N/A N/A n/a n/a Per Contract $1,550 LS  TBD - - N/A 1 $1,800 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,350 NO BID

83

Norweco Singulair 
TNT 1250 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,450 Per Unit $1,350 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,575.06 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS  TBD - - N/A 1 $1,800 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,350 NO BID

84

Norweco Singulair 
TNT 1500 Three-
year O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,600 Per Unit $1,500 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,738 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS  TBD - - N/A 1 $2,000 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,500 NO BID

85

Norweco Hydro-
Kinetic HK 600 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year $1,125 N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,150 Per Unit $1,050 Three-year $1,300 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS $1,375 3 year $1,150 N/A 1 $1,400 

Three-year 
Contract $1,050 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,050 NO BID

86

Norweco Hydro-
Kinetic HK 800 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,200 Three-year $1,450 

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS $1,550 3 year $1,300 N/A 1 $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,200 3 Yr $1,500 NA 3 year $1,200 NO BID

87

Norweco Hydro-
Kinetic HK 1000 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,450 Per Unit $1,350 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,575.06 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS $1,675 3 year $1,475 N/A 1 $1,800 

Three-year 
Contract $1,350 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,350 NO BID

88

Norweco Hydro-
Kinetic HK 1250 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,450 Per Unit $1,350 Three-year $1,600 

Three-year 
Contract $1,575.06 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS $1,675 3 year $1,475 N/A 1 $1,800 

Three-year 
Contract $1,350 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,350 NO BID

89

Norweco Hydro-
Kinetic HK 1500 
Three-year O&M 
Contract Three-year  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,600 Per Unit $1,500 Three-year $1,750 

Three-year 
Contract $1,738 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS $1,850 3 year $1,650 N/A 1 $2,000 

Three-year 
Contract $1,500 3 Yr $1,800 NA 3 year $1,500 NO BID

90

SeptiTech STAAR 
0.5 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $900 N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,000 Per Unit $900 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,222.03 N/A N/A n/a n/a LS TBD 3 year $1,000 N/A 1 $400 3 Yr $1,500 NA NO BID

91

SeptiTech STAAR 
0.75 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year $900 N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,150 Per Unit $1,050 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS TBD 3 year $1,150 N/A 1 $1,400 3 Yr $1,500 NA NO BID

92

SeptiTech STAAR 
1.0 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 year $1,300 Per Unit $1,200 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,466.44 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,350 N/A 1 $1,600 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID

93

SeptiTech STAAR 
1.2 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Per Unit $1,500 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $1,738 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,350 N/A 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID

94

SeptiTech STAAR 
1.5 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Per Unit $1,800 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $2,063.88 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,500 N/A 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID

95

SeptiTech STAAR 
3.0 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Per Unit $2,500 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $2,824.25 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,500 N/A 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID

96

SeptiTech STAAR 
3.5 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Doesn't Exist Doesn't Exist Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $3,476 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,650 N/A 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID

97

SeptiTech STAAR 
4.0 Three-year 
O&M Contract Three-year  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Per Unit $3,600 Three-year TBD

Three-year 
Contract $4,019.13 N/A N/A n/a  n/a LS  TBD 3 year $1,650 N/A 3 Yr $1,800 NA NO BID


